
Celebrating  Excellence:  Est-
Marie’s Journey in Law
We are thrilled to celebrate the remarkable achievements of our director, Est-
Marie, who has recently obtained her master’s degree in Constitutional Law cum
laude.  Est-Marie’s journey in law is  a testament to her dedication,  skill,  and
unwavering commitment to excellence.

RSG listeners will recognise her name. She regularly gives expert legal advice on
the RSG programme Regsake.

Est-Marie’s  academic  journey  began  in  Potchefstroom  at  the  North-West
University, where she obtained her LLB degree with distinction in 2014. Her
outstanding  academic  performance  earned  her  an  invitation  to  join  the
prestigious Golden Key International Honour Society. This recognition was just
the beginning of a stellar career in law.

In  2015,  Est-Marie  joined  Van  Velden-Duffey.  Her  passion  for  law  and  her
meticulous  approach  quickly  set  her  apart.  Over  the  years,  she  has  gained
extensive experience in various areas of law, specialising in general High Court
and Magistrates’ Court Civil Litigation. Her expertise includes handling evictions,
rental  disputes,  contractual  disputes,  damages  claims,  National  Credit  Act
matters,  Consumer  Protection  Act  matters,  and  debt  reviews.

Her leadership and legal acumen have been invaluable to our team. In 2024, she
furthered her legal  education by completing her  LLM with distinction,  again
demonstrating her commitment to continuous learning and professional growth.

Throughout her career, Est-Marie has been highly regarded for her meticulous
approach to legal matters and her commitment to providing personalised and
results-driven legal services. Her ability to navigate complex legal issues with
precision and care has earned her the respect of both colleagues and clients.

As we celebrate Est-Marie’s achievements, we are reminded of the values that
drive our firm: excellence, dedication, and a commitment to serving our clients
with the highest standards of professionalism. Est-Marie embodies these values,
and we are proud to have her as a co-director and key team member.
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Congratulations,  Est-Marie,  on  your  outstanding  accomplishments.  We  look
forward  to  many  more  years  of  success  and  leadership  in  the  legal  field.


